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Genesis 6:9-7:24 
These are the generations of Noah. Noah was a righteous man, blameless in 
his generation. Noah walked with God. And Noah had three sons, Shem, 
Ham, and Japheth. Now the earth was corrupt in God’s sight, and the earth 
was filled with violence. And God saw the earth, and behold, it was corrupt, 
for all flesh had corrupted their way on the earth. And God said to Noah, “I 
have determined to make an end of all flesh, for the earth is filled with 
violence through them. Behold, I will destroy them with the earth. Make 
yourself an ark of gopher wood. Make rooms in the ark, and cover it inside 
and out with pitch. This is how you are to make it: the length of the ark 300 
cubits, its breadth 50 cubits, and its height 30 cubits. Make a roof for the ark, 
and finish it to a cubit above, and set the door of the ark in its side. Make it 
with lower, second, and third decks. For behold, I will bring a flood of waters 
upon the earth to destroy all flesh in which is the breath of life under heaven. 
Everything that is on the earth shall die. But I will establish my covenant with 
you, and you shall come into the ark, you, your sons, your wife, and your 
sons’ wives with you. And of every living thing of all flesh, you shall bring 
two of every sort into the ark to keep them alive with you. They shall be male 
and female. Of the birds according to their kinds, and of the animals 
according to their kinds, of every creeping thing of the ground, according to 
its kind, two of every sort shall come in to you to keep them alive. Also take 
with you every sort of food that is eaten, and store it up. It shall serve as food 
for you and for them.” Noah did this; he did all that God commanded him. 
Then the LORD said to Noah, “Go into the ark, you and all your household, 
for I have seen that you are righteous before me in this generation. Take with 
you seven pairs of all clean animals, the male and his mate, and a pair of the 
animals that are not clean, the male and his mate, and seven pairs of the birds 
of the heavens also, male and female, to keep their offspring alive on the face 
of all the earth. For in seven days I will send rain on the earth forty days and 
forty nights, and every living thing that I have made I will blot out from the 
face of the ground.” And Noah did all that the LORD had commanded him. 
Noah was six hundred years old when the flood of waters came upon the 
earth. And Noah and his sons and his wife and his sons’ wives with him went 



into the ark to escape the waters of the flood. Of clean animals, and of 
animals that are not clean, and of birds, and of everything that creeps on the 
ground, two and two, male and female, went into the ark with Noah, as God 
had commanded Noah. And after seven days the waters of the flood came 
upon the earth. In the six hundredth year of Noah’s life, in the second month, 
on the seventeenth day of the month, on that day all the fountains of the great 
deep burst forth, and the windows of the heavens were opened. And rain fell 
upon the earth forty days and forty nights. On the very same day Noah and 
his sons, Shem and Ham and Japheth, and Noah’s wife and the three wives of 
his sons with them entered the ark, they and every beast, according to its 
kind, and all the livestock according to their kinds, and every creeping thing 
that creeps on the earth, according to its kind, and every bird, according to its 
kind, every winged creature. They went into the ark with Noah, two and two 
of all flesh in which there was the breath of life. And those that entered, male 
and female of all flesh, went in as God had commanded him. And the LORD 
shut him in. The flood continued forty days on the earth. The waters 
increased and bore up the ark, and it rose high above the earth. The waters 
prevailed and increased greatly on the earth, and the ark floated on the face of 
the waters. And the waters prevailed so mightily on the earth that all the high 
mountains under the whole heaven were covered. The waters prevailed above 
the mountains, covering them fifteen cubits deep. And all flesh died that 
moved on the earth, birds, livestock, beasts, all swarming creatures that 
swarm on the earth, and all mankind. Everything on the dry land in whose 
nostrils was the breath of life died. He blotted out every living thing that was 
on the face of the ground, man and animals and creeping things and birds of 
the heavens. They were blotted out from the earth. Only Noah was left, and 
those who were with him in the ark. And the waters prevailed on the earth 
150 days. 
 
I. God justly judges sinners. (6:11-13, 7:10-12, 17-23a) 

 
“When we confess that God is infinitely, eternally, and unchangeably just, we 
are saying that He never looks the other way. He never winks at sin. He never 
excuses wickedness. The justice of God is fundamental to the character of 
God and provides the fuel for the praises of His people in every age. He must 
be just because He is unchangeably and necessarily righteous and good in all 
He does.” - David Strain 



 
 2 Peter 2:5 
God brought a flood upon the world of the ungodly. 
 
Romans 6:23 
For the wages of sin is death… 
 
II. Even though humans are sinful, God establishes a relationship by 
grace through faith. (6:9-10, 14-21, 7:1-4, 23b-24) 
 
Hebrews 11:7 
By faith Noah, being warned by God concerning events as yet unseen, in 
reverent fear constructed an ark for the saving of his household. By this he 
condemned the world and became an heir of the righteousness that comes by 
faith.  
 
Main Idea: Sin leads to death, but God’s promise leads to life.  
 
Romans 6:23 
For the wages of sin is death, but the free gift of God is eternal life in Christ 
Jesus our Lord.  
 
2 Peter 2:5, 9 
. . . if he did not spare the ancient world, but preserved Noah, a herald of 
righteousness, with seven others, when he brought a flood upon the world of 
the ungodly . . . then the Lord knows how to rescue the godly from trials, and 
to keep the unrighteous under punishment until the day of judgment 
 
2 Peter 3:5-7 
For they deliberately overlook this fact, that the heavens existed long ago, 
and the earth was formed out of water and through water by the word of God, 
and that by means of these the world that then existed was deluged with 
water and perished. But by the same word the heavens and earth that now 
exist are stored up for fire, being kept until the day of judgment and 
destruction of the ungodly. 
 
Main Idea: Sin leads to death, but God’s promise leads to life.  



 
2 Peter 3:8-10 
But do not overlook this one fact, beloved, that with the Lord one day is as a 
thousand years, and a thousand years as one day. The Lord is not slow to 
fulfill his promise as some count slowness, but is patient toward you, not 
wishing that any should perish, but that all should reach repentance. But the 
day of the Lord will come like a thief, and then the heavens will pass away 
with a roar, and the heavenly bodies will be burned up and dissolved, and the 
earth and the works that are done on it will be exposed.  
 
Main Idea: Sin leads to death, but God’s promise leads to life. 
 
III. The right response to God’s grace is obedience (6:22, 7:5-9, 13-16)  
 
2 Peter 3:11-13 
Since all these things are thus to be dissolved, what sort of people ought you 
to be in lives of holiness and godliness, waiting for and hastening the coming 
of the day of God, because of which the heavens will be set on fire and 
dissolved, and the heavenly bodies will melt as they burn! But according to 
his promise we are waiting for new heavens and a new earth in which 
righteousness dwells.  
 
Main Idea: Sin leads to death, but God’s promise leads to life.  
 
 
 
 


