
 
welcome to 

CLEARWATER COMMUNITY CHURCH 
June 17, 2018 

song set: 
O Praise The Name ::  Hillsong Worship 

Praise The King ::  Corey Voss 

The Cause Of Christ ::  Kari Jobe 

Your Labor Is Not In Vain ::  Paul Zach 

 



Announcements 
Happy Father’s Day  ::  Happy Father’s Day to all the dads and 
men filling the role of a father figure! Thank you for inspiring, 
teaching and protecting! 

The Piquettes  ::  To make a donation for the Piquettes you may 
visit www.elic.org/supportateacher and enter code P266. 

Directory Photos  ::  If you need to submit a photo, please visit 
our website to pay the $10 fee and learn where to submit your 
image. The $10 includes one copy of the directory. Additional 
copies may be purchased for $5. 

First Impressions  ::  Training for anyone interested in joining the 
team will be on June 24th from 9:00-10:45AM in the High School 
Room of the Student Center. Contact Kari: karikee13@gmail.com. 

Nicaragua Trip  ::  This Christmas mission trip will be from Dec. 
1st—8th. There is an informational meeting on June 24th at 
12:15PM in room 101. Attending is not a commitment to go. 

Harriet’s  ::  Men are needed to do pickups at grocery stores on 
Mondays and Thursdays every other week. Please contact Isaac 
at 717-481-9851 if you can help regularly or as an alternate. Also, 
Harriet’s hopes to open 2 Saturdays a month beginning this fall. 
This could be your serving opportunity! Contact Sharon Wilson at 
morgenmaya@gmail.com to help. 

Cyprus Mission Trip  ::  Departs June 28th and returns July 9th. 
Please keep this team of 12 in your prayers. To make a donation 
to the trip, denote “Cyprus” in the note area of your check and 
drop it in today’s offering. 

Lost and Found  ::  Missing something? Be sure to check the lost 
and found corner in the Living Room. Unclaimed items will be 
donated at the end of June. 

Visit our website to register for the events listed above and for more 
details about ongoing events and ministries. 

mailto:morgenmaya@gmail.com

