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Definition (project when I begin to talk about it):


“Christian Spiritual Formation is the 

Holy Spirit guided and empowered process 


by which we are transformed into the likeness of Jesus 

for the sake of the world.”


(As the sermon progresses, please project the title and text reference, and then the verses as 
paragraphed. I will read the whole text and then go back over it and make a few comments. It would be 
great if you could leave the text on as I am talking about it.)


John 14:23-27 – Abiding in His Love, Receiving His Peace

Jesus answered and said to him, “If anyone loves Me, he will keep My word; and My Father will love him, 
and We will come to him and make Our abode with him. He who does not love Me does not keep My 
words; and the word which you hear is not Mine, but the Father’s who sent Me.


These things I have spoken to you while abiding with you. But the Helper, the Holy Spirit, whom the 
Father will send in My name, He will teach you all things, and bring to your remembrance all that I said 
to you. Peace I leave with you; My peace I give to you; not as the world gives do I give to you. Do not let 
your heart be troubled, nor let it be fearful.”


John 15:9-11 – Abiding in His Love, Receiving His Joy

Just as the Father has loved Me, I have also loved you; abide in My love. “If you keep My 
commandments, you will abide in My love; just as I have kept My Father’s commandments and abide in 
His love. These things I have spoken to you so that My joy may be in you, and that your joy may be made 
full.


John 15:14-15 – From obedient servants to responsible friends

You are My friends if you do what I command you. “No longer do I call you slaves, for the slave does not 
know what his master is doing; but I have called you friends, for all things that I have heard from My 
Father I have made known to you. “You did not choose Me but I chose you, and appointed you that you 
would go and bear fruit, and that your fruit would remain, so that whatever you ask of the Father in My 
name He may give to you.




1 Corinthians 2:14-16 – Learning to Think the Way Jesus Thinks

But a natural man does not accept the things of the Spirit of God, for they are foolishness to him; and he 
cannot understand them, because they are spiritually appraised. But he who is spiritual appraises all 
things, yet he himself is appraised by no one. For WHO HAS KNOWN THE MIND OF THE LORD, THAT HE 
WILL INSTRUCT HIM? But we have the mind of Christ.


1 John 3:1-3 – Knowing Arises out of Seeing

See how great a love the Father has bestowed on us, that we would be called children of God; and such 
we are. For this reason the world does not know us, because it did not know Him. 


Beloved, now we are children of God, and it has not appeared as yet what we will be. We know that 
when He appears, we will be like Him, because we will see Him just as He is. And everyone who has this 
hope fixed on Him purifies himself, just as He is pure.


Ephesians 3:14-21 – Built for the Fullness of God

For this reason I bow my knees before the Father, from whom every family in heaven and on earth 
derives its name, that He would grant you, according to the riches of His glory, to be strengthened with 
power through His Spirit in the inner man, so that Christ may dwell in your hearts through faith; 


and that you, being rooted and grounded in love, may be able to comprehend with all the saints what is 
the breadth and length and height and depth, and to know the love of Christ which surpasses 
knowledge, that you may be filled up to all the fullness of God.


Now to Him who is able to do far more abundantly beyond all that we ask or think, according to the 
power that works within us, to Him be the glory in the church and in Christ Jesus to all generations 
forever and ever. Amen.


Matthew 28:16-20 – But, in the meantime…

But the eleven disciples proceeded to Galilee, to the mountain which Jesus had designated. When they 
saw Him, they worshiped Him; but some were doubtful. And Jesus came up and spoke to them, saying, 
“All authority has been given to Me in heaven and on earth.


Go therefore and make disciples of all the nations, baptizing them in the name of the Father and the Son 
and the Holy Spirit, teaching them to observe all that I commanded you; and lo, I am with you always, 
even to the end of the age.”


