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Romans 5:10-11 CSB 
For if while we were enemies , we were reconciled to God through the 
death of his Son, then how much more, having been reconciled , will we be 
saved by His life.  And not only that, but we also rejoice in God through our 
Lord Jesus Christ, through whom we have now received this reconciliation. 
 
 
Romans 5:15-17 NIV 
But the gift is not like the trespass (or sin). For if the many died by the 
trespass of the one man, how much more did God’s grace and the gift that 
came by the grace of the one man, Jesus Christ, overflow to the many! Nor 
can the gift of God be compared with the result of one man’s sin: The 
judgement followed one sin and brought condemnation, but the gift 
followed many trespasses and brought justification.  For if, by the trespass 
of the one man, death reigned through that one man, how much more will 
those who receive God’s abundant provision of grace and of the gift of 
righteousness reign in life through the one man, Jesus Christ!   

 
 
Grace is "the undeserved, unmerited love of God for those who were 
undeserving and not faithful to God," and, this is best understood in the 
stories of God's pursuit of His people.                Justin Holcomb 
 
 
Genesis 32:24-28 CSB 
Jacob was left alone, and a man wrestled with him until daybreak.  When 
the man saw that He could not defeat him, He struck Jacob’s hip socket as 
they wrestled and dislocated his hip.  Then He said to Jacob, “Let me go, 
for it is daybreak.”  But Jacob said, “I will not let you go unless you bless 
me.”  “What is your name?” the Man asked.  “Jacob,” he replied.  “Your 
name will no longer be Jacob,” He said. “It will be Israel because you have 
struggled with God and with men and have prevailed.” 
 
 
“True ambition is the desire to live usefully and walk humbly under the 
grace of God.” 
― Alcoholics Anonymous World Services 
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1 Corinthians 6:19-20 NIV 
Do you not know that your bodies are temples of the Holy Spirit of God, 
who is in you, whom you have received from God? You are not your own; 
you were bought at a price. Therefore honor God with your bodies. 
 
 
1 Clement 3:4 
“For this cause righteousness and peace stand aloof, while each man hath 
forsaken the fear of the Lord and become purblind in the faith of Him, 
neither walketh in the ordinances of His commandments nor liveth 
according to that which becometh Christ, but each goeth after the lusts of 
his evil heart, seeing that they have conceived an unrighteous and ungodly 
jealousy, through which also death entered into the world.” 

 
Romans 5:18-21 NIV 
Consequently, just as one trespass resulted in condemnation for all people, 
so also one righteous act resulted in justification and life for all people.  For 
just as through the disobedience of the one man the many were made 
sinners, so also through the obedience of the one man the many will be 
made righteous.  The law was brought in so that the trespass might 
increase.  But where sin increased, grace increased all the more, so that, 
just as sin reigned in death, so also grace might reign through 
righteousness to bring eternal life through Jesus Christ our Lord. 
 
 


