


To raise up anointed disciple-makers who are empowered to change their 
world for Christ.

OUR VISION:



2023 - OUR YEAR OF 

GREAT GRACE



And with great power the apostles were giving their testimony to the 
resurrection of the Lord Jesus, and great grace was upon them all.

Acts 4:33 (ESV)





16 For I am not ashamed of the gospel, for it is the power of God for 
salvation to everyone who believes, to the Jew first and also to the Greek.

Romans 1:16 (ESV)



1 Paul, a servant of Christ Jesus, …
Romans 1:1a (ESV)



10 Am I now trying to win the approval of human beings, or of God? Or 
am I trying to please people? If I were still trying to please people, I 
would not be a servant of Christ.

Galatians 1:10 (NIV)



7 To all those in Rome who are loved by God and called to be saints: 
Grace to you and peace from God our Father and the Lord Jesus Christ.

Romans 1:7 (ESV)



8 First, I thank my God through Jesus Christ for all of you, because your 
faith is proclaimed in all the world.

Romans 1:8 (ESV)





1 …, called to be an apostle, set apart for the gospel of God,
Romans 1:1b (ESV)



2 While they were worshiping the Lord and fasting, the Holy Spirit said, 
“Set apart for me Barnabas and Saul for the work to which I have called 
them.”

Acts 13:2 (NIV)



2 which he promised beforehand through his prophets in the holy 
Scriptures, 3 concerning his Son, who was descended from David 
according to the flesh 4 and was declared to be the Son of God in power 
according to the Spirit of holiness by his resurrection from the dead, 
Jesus Christ our Lord,

Romans 1:2-4 (ESV)



5 through whom we have received grace and apostleship to bring about 
the obedience of faith for the sake of his name among all the nations, 6 
including you who are called to belong to Jesus Christ, 

Romans 1:5-6 (ESV)



2 who have been chosen according to the foreknowledge of God the 
Father, through the sanctifying work of the Spirit, to be obedient to Jesus 
Christ and sprinkled with his blood: Grace and peace be yours in 
abundance.

1 Peter 1:2 (NIV)





9 For God is my witness, whom I serve with my spirit in the gospel of his 
Son, that without ceasing I mention you 10 always in my prayers, asking 
that somehow by God’s will I may now at last succeed in coming to you.

Romans 1:9-10 (ESV)



11 For I long to see you, that I may impart to you some spiritual gift to 
strengthen you— 12 that is, that we may be mutually encouraged by each 
other’s faith, both yours and mine.

Romans 1:11-12 (ESV)



13 I do not want you to be unaware, brothers, that I have often intended 
to come to you (but thus far have been prevented), in order that I may 
reap some harvest among you as well as among the rest of the Gentiles.

Romans 1:13 (ESV)





14 I am under obligation both to Greeks and to barbarians, both to the 
wise and to the foolish.

Romans 1:14 (ESV)



14 I am debtor both to the Greeks, and to the Barbarians; both to the 
wise, and to the unwise.

Romans 1:14 (KJV 1900)



11 Here there is no Gentile or Jew, circumcised or uncircumcised, 
barbarian, Scythian, slave or free, but Christ is all, and is in all.

Colossians 3:11 (NIV)



15 So I am eager to preach the gospel to you also who are in Rome.
Romans 1:15 (ESV)





16 For I am not ashamed of the gospel, for it is the power of God for 
salvation to everyone who believes, to the Jew first and also to the Greek.

Romans 1:16 (ESV)



17 For in it the righteousness of God is revealed from faith for faith, as it 
is written, “The righteous shall live by faith.”

Romans 1:17a (ESV)



21 For our sake he made him to be sin who knew no sin, so that in him we 
might become the righteousness of God.

2 Corinthians 5:21 (ESV)



17 For in it the righteousness of God is revealed from faith for faith, as it 
is written, “The righteous shall live by faith.”

Romans 1:17b (ESV)



17 This Good News tells us how God makes us right in his sight. This is 
accomplished from start to finish by faith. As the Scriptures say, “It is 
through faith that a righteous person has life.”

Romans 1:17 (NLT)



17 For in it the righteousness of God is revealed from faith for faith, as it 
is written, “The righteous shall live by faith.”

Romans 1:17c (ESV)



4 “See, the enemy is puffed up; his desires are not upright— but the 
righteous person will live by his faithfulness—

Habakkuk 2:4 (NIV)



11 Now it is evident that no one is justified before God by the law, for 
“The righteous shall live by faith.”

Galatians 3:11 (ESV)





16 For I am not ashamed of the gospel, for it is the power of God for 
salvation to everyone who believes, to the Jew first and also to the Greek.

Romans 1:16 (ESV)




