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 Petition: Requests for ourselves, prayer for ourselves to be sensitive to ministry opportunities, 
pray for the Holy Spirit to cleanse us and reveal the truth about us – how God sees us. Phil 4:6 

 Communion: Praise, loving on God, soaking in His presence 
 Intercession: Prayer for the needs of others, pray for the people God will bring to you to disciple 

From the Welsh Revival: BEND ME: 1) Confess all known sins, 2) Remove anything in my life that is in 
doubt or I am unsure of, 3) OBEY the Holy Spirit instantly, and 4) Publicly Confess faith 

Being a disciple is, at the core, about walking in a spirit of circumcision. Circumcision is about giving 
one’s most intimate part to God. Circumcision is about bleeding and marking the most intimate place in 
our soul as belonging to God. The secret place – intimate place – between us and the Lord. It is about 
obedience. 
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Scriptures for Week 3 (CSB translation): 

Lamentations 3:40 “Let’s examine and probe our ways, and turn back to the Lord.” 

1 Cor 11:28 “Let a person examine himself, in this way let him eat the bread and drink from the cup.” 

Gal 6:4 “Let each person examine his own work, and then he can take pride in himself alone, and not 
compare himself with someone else.” 

2 Cor 13:5 “Test yourselves to see if you are in the faith. Examine yourselves. Or do you yourselves not 
recognize that Jesus Christ is in you?” 

Deut 6:4-9 “Listen, Israel: The Lord our God, the Lord is one. Love the Lord your God with all your heart, 
with all your soul, and with all your strength. These words that I am giving you today are to be in your 
heart. Repeat them to your children. Talk about them when you sit in your house and hen you walk 
along the road, when you lie down and when you get up. Bind them as a sign on your house and on your 
city gates.” 

1 Cor 8:6 “For us there is one God, the Father. All things are from him, and we exist for him. And there is 
one Lord, Jesus Christ. All things are through him, and we exist through him.”  

“Take up my yoke and learn from me, because I am lowly and humble in heart, and you will find rest for 
your souls.” (Matt 11:29) 

1 Peter 3:15-16 “…but in your hearts regard Christ the Lord as holy, ready at any time to give a defense 
to anyone who asks you for a reason for the hope that is in you. Yet do this with gentleness and 
reverence, keeping a clear conscience, so that when you are accused, those who disparage your good 
conduct in Christ will be put to shame.” 

Matt 3:15 “Jesus answered him, “Allow it for now, because this is the way for us to fulfill all 
righteousness.” Then John allowed him to be baptized.” 

1 Thess 5:22 (KJV) Abstain from all appearance of evil. 

NIV: reject every kind of evil. 

ESV: Abstain from every form of evil. 

NASB: abstain from every form of evil. 

NLT: Stay away from every kind of evil. 

CSB: Stay away from every kind of evil. 

1 Cor 10:12 “So, whoever thinks he stands must be careful not to fall.”  

Eph 5:15-16 “Pay careful attention, then, to how you walk – not as unwise people but as wise – making 
the most of the time, because the days are evil.  

1 Cor 8:9 “But be careful that this right of yours in no way becomes a stumbling block to the weak.”  
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Luke 5:37-39 “And no one puts new wine into old wineskins. Otherwise, the new wine will burst the 
skins, it will spill, and the skins will be ruined. No, new wine is put into fresh wineskins. And no one, after 
drinking old wine, wants new, because he says, The old is better. 

Ephesians 4: 13-16  And he himself gave some to be apostles, some prophets, some evangelists, some 
pastors and teachers, to equip the saints for the work of ministry, to build up the body of Christ, until we 
all reach unity in the faith and in the knowledge of God’s Son, growing into maturity with a stature 
measured by Christ’s fullness. Then we will no longer be little children, tossed by the waves and blown 
around by every wind of teaching, by human cunning with cleverness in the techniques of deceit. But 
speaking the truth in love, let us grow in every way into him who is the head – Christ. From him the 
whole body, fitted and knit together by every supporting ligament, promotes the growth of the body for 
building itself up in love by the proper working of each individual part. 

  


